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Amadeusz Sanchez 
As someone who has served in multiple leadership positions, and who has a passion for helping others, I think I would 
make a great fit for the Chair of Club Affairs. At De Anza I have served as the VP for Model United Nations, attending the 
biweekly ICC meetings throughout my term. Through that experience, I have learned the intricacies of how the 
relationship between club and ICC work. Using these skills, I will be able to lead Club Affairs effectively and with 
enthusiasm. I hope to help all clubs stay active and thriving during my term in any way I can! 

 

Brandon Bong 
This role would be a valuable learning opportunity for me in many ways. I would love to improve my multi-tasking skills, 
accumulate work experience, and help serve the student body. I genuinely hope you will give me a chance. I am eager to 
learn and strive, and I will sincerely do the best in my power to complete the tasks given to me.  
 
I have attended almost every ICC Agenda and Executive Meeting while interning for ICC in the past two quarters. I am 
suitable for the job. I say this because of the character developed by my military background. I served in the Singapore 
Army for two years as a medic, starting at 16. During that time, I faced extreme physical and mental challenges, such as 
marching 24 kilometers while carrying 19 kilograms of load for the route march before my graduation, just as an 
example. My unique experiences and a “can-do” attitude to tackle challenges will certainly equip me to do well in this 
position. I hope you agree with my self-assessment and that you could use someone with my unique background and 
experiences. I appreciate your consideration. 

 

Elizabeth Tsai 
ICC holds the most control when it comes to extracurriculars and hobbies. They provide clubs with resources that can 
shape their club to construct something special within the school community. It's the gateway to making connections. I 
want to contribute and be a part of the ones that shaped my first year of college. Through my observation, I regard the 
Chair of Club Affairs as THE entrance for others to make an impact in the community. It's also the position that provides 
the most advice for those who want to start something new and unique. I have been an intern for a quarter and have 
attended many ICC Representative Meetings. Furthermore, I find myself going to each club's events and learning about 
how each club, society, and organization is important. Additionally, I started a club for languages in Winter of 2024 and I 
feel that this gave me insight into the responsibilities of the Chair of Club Affairs. Through these factors, I believe that 
the Chair of Club Affairs is a great position that would fit me. 

 

Yin Wa Yung 
My interest in joining the ICC as the Chair of Club Affairs can be described as a crucible of gathering experience and 
leaving an impact. I can't deny the fact that when I heard the news, I had to seize the opportunity to build my transcript. 
However, I realized that this was not the only thing I could get out of it. Given the fact that I had also gone through the 
process of reactivating clubs, I experienced first-hand the role of Club Affairs and came to an understanding of just how 
essential this role is in guiding clubs toward their success. And so given the opportunity, I would like to offer my service 
and help newly activated clubs, or even students who are just starting at De Anza interested in starting a club. I believe 
that this position can deliver tremendous impacts to De Anza students and clubs, and I would like to be part of said 
impact. It is my understanding that new clubs are starting to pop up as part of post-covid reactivation, which makes it 
even more fundamental for ICC to improve their club management strategies and expand through the position of Chair 
of Club Affairs. 
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